

# **Colquitt County Board of Education Special Called Board Meeting Friday, July 24, 2009 ~ 1:00 p.m.**

The Colquitt County Board of Education met in a special called session on Friday, July 24, 2009 at 1:00 p.m. in the Central Office of the Colquitt County Board of Education. Members of the Board present were: Mrs. Jerry Meister, chairman; Mr. Roy Reeves, vice-chairman; Mrs. Debra Hampton, Mr. Tim Henry, Mr. Jimmy Taylor and Mrs. Trudie Hill. The meeting was rescheduled from Monday, July 27, 2009 at 7:00 p.m. to Friday, July 24, 2009 at 1:00 p.m. due to lack of quorum for the regular Monday night meeting.

The meeting was called to order by Mrs. Meister.

The invocation was given by Mrs. Trudie Hill.

The Pledge of Allegiance to the American Flag was let by Mrs. Meister.

Mrs. Meister presented the revised proposed agenda for approval. The motion to approve was made by Mrs. Trudie Hill, seconded by Mrs. Debra Hampton and carried unanimously.

Mrs. Meister requested Board consensus for the paying of the bills and of the following minutes:

Regular Board Meeting ~ June 22, 2009

Technology Committee Meetings ~ June 22, 2009 and July 8, 2009

Transportation Committee Meeting ~ July 7, 2009

Work Session Meeting ~ July 13, 2009

Approval was given by Board consensus.

Mr. McCoy spoke of the conference call from Governor Perdue to all Superintendents in the state of Georgia. Governor Perdue stated that all Quality Based Education (QBE) would be reduced by 3% and asked that three (3) furlough days be implemented across the state. Mr. McCoy recommended Board approval to set the furlough days of August 14, 2009, January 4, 2010 and June 2, 2010. The motion to approve was made by Mr. Jimmy Taylor, seconded by Mrs. Trudie Hill and carried unanimously.

Mr. McCoy recommended Board approval for the application of the furloughs as follows:

Bus drivers are employed for 180 days will not be furloughed.

Cafeteria employees who work 184 days will be furloughed for one day.

All employees who work 190 or more days will be furloughed for three days. The furlough days to be taken for those who work 190 days are August 14, 2009; January 4, 2010; and June 2, 2010.

In situations where it is critical to providing access and essential services, supervisors are authorized to set furlough days for those who are employed for more than 190 days.

Any professional employees working on a 49% contract shall be furloughed 1.5 days.

Records including time sheets shall reflect mandated furlough days. A review shall be conducted periodically to ensure compliance.

The superintendent is authorized to address any other situations not addressed in this process for application and report to the Board.

Mr. McCoy stated that no one would be able to use any personal/leave days as furlough days.

The motion to approve was made by Mr. Tim Henry, seconded by Mr. Roy Reeves and carried unanimously.

Mr. McCoy recommended Board approval to amend the Open House schedule for Gray Jr. High due to the furlough day of August 14, 2009. The new Open House schedule for Gray Jr. High is Thursday, August 13, 2009 from 2-8 p.m. The motion to approve was made by Mrs. Trudie Hill, seconded by Mr. Tim Henry and carried unanimously.

Mr. McCoy recommended Board approval of the final Fiscal Year 2009 Budget with adjustments. The motion to approve was made by Mrs. Debra Hampton, seconded by Mr. Tim Henry and carried unanimously.

Mr. McCoy recommended Board approval of a tentative FY 2010 Budget to be advertised. The motion to approve was made by Mrs. Trudie Hill, seconded by Mr. Jimmy Taylor and carried unanimously.

Mr. McCoy recommended Board approval of the 2009-2010 Pay Supplements. Mr. McCoy stated that there are no changes from the past school year other than those already Board approved as some of the supplements in athletics and in others where adjustments were made. To eliminate confusion, the pay supplements presented to the Board as a handout were voted on. The motion to approve was made by Mrs. Debra Hampton, seconded by Mrs. Trudie Hill and carried unanimously.

Mr. McCoy recommended Board approval of the Bid Recap for instructional supplies. The recommended bid is outlined. Lowest bid is recommended unless the quality, brand specified or certain requirements are not met.

13-Jul-09						
<b>DENOTES RECOMMENDED BID</b>						
<b>**DENOTES INCOMPLETE BID</b>						
	1 chart paper	2 index cards	3 envelopes	4 pencils	5 laminator film	
AFP School Supply	\$986.40			\$3,193.20	\$4,852.00	
Bender-burkot East Coast School	\$990.00	\$225.00	\$2,710.00	\$7,044.00	\$7,596.00	
Bye-Mo'R, Inc.	\$882.00	\$200.00	\$2,164.00		\$4,996.00	
GBC					\$6,700.00	
J & P Enterprise SJC, INC	\$1,364.40	\$220.00	\$2,746.00	** \$2,665.20	\$7,600.00	
Pyramid School Products	\$828.00	\$150.00	\$2,200.00	\$2,738.40	\$4,596.00	
School Specialty	\$896.40	no \$165.00	\$2,544.00	\$2,828.40	\$6,116.00	
Standard Stationery Supply/Best schoolbuys.com	\$831.60	\$149.00	\$2,182.00	\$2,405.76	\$4,456.00	
	6 file folders	7 post-it notes	8 pencil pouches	9 desk pad calendar	10 pencil sharpeners	
AFP School Supply	\$2,032.35	\$3,974.40	\$688.00			
Bender-Burkot East Coast School	\$1,887.00	\$4,212.00	\$1,200.00	\$1,707.00	\$2,036.16	
Bye-Mo'R, Inc.		\$3,931.60	\$635.20		\$1,869.12	
J & P Enterprise SJC, INC	\$3,570.00	\$4,399.60		\$1,500.00		
Pyramid School Products	\$2,027.25	\$3,444.00	\$1,200.00	\$1,467.00	\$1,807.20	
School Specialty	\$3,322.65	\$5,502.00	\$336.00	\$1,074.00	\$2,268.00	
Standard Stationery Supply/Best schoolbuys.com	\$2,034.90	\$3,516.40			\$1,703.52	
	11 markers	12 markers, dry erase	13 eraser, pink & dry erase	14 scissors	15 stapler	
AFP School Supply	\$1,990.08	\$5,212.80		\$432.00	\$775.20	
Bender-Burkot East Coast School	\$3,041.28	\$9,598.80	** \$496.80	\$612.00	\$1,149.60	
Bye-Mo'R, Inc.	\$2,090.88	\$7,501.20	\$894.96	\$540.00	\$813.60	
J & P Enterprise SJC, INC	\$7,761.60	\$10,908.00	** \$453.60	\$576.00	\$792.00	
Pyramid School Products	\$1,942.56	\$7,474.80	\$739.44	\$352.80	\$744.48	
School Specialty	\$5,610.24 ?	\$10,422.00	\$928.00	\$302.40	\$2,712.00	
Standard Stationery Supply/Best schoolbuys.com	\$1,520.64	\$8,320.80	\$744.48	\$315.36	\$319.20	

	16	tape, masking	17	3-ring binders	18	dividers	19	highlighters	20	2-pocket folders
AFP School Supply				\$9,482.40		\$2,400.00		\$558.72		
Bender-Burkot East Coast School		\$712.80		\$13,960.80		\$3,520.00		\$1,347.84	**	\$6,875.00
Bye-Mo'R, Inc.		\$734.40		\$23,397.60				\$1,431.36	**	\$5,150.00
J & P Enterprise SJC, INC		\$2,376.00		\$18,516.00		\$2,000.00		\$1,483.20	**	\$10,320.00
Pyramid School Products		\$676.80		\$9,451.20		\$1,600.00		\$457.92		\$5,628.00
School Specialty		\$806.40		\$13,240.80		\$1,440.00		\$1,454.40	**	\$3,920.00
Standard Stationery Supply/Best schoolbuys.com		\$639.36		\$22,924.80		\$1,784.00		\$368.64		\$4,311.60
	21	crayons	22	tempera paint						
AFP School Supply										
Bender-Burkot East Coast School		\$7,956.00		\$330.60						
Bye-Mo'R, Inc.										
J & P Enterprise SJC, INC	**	\$8,913.60		\$859.56						
Pyramid School Products		\$6,616.80		\$344.52						
School Specialty		\$5,839.20		\$511.56						
Standard Stationery Supply/Best schoolbuys.com				\$396.72						

The motion to approve was made by Mr. Roy Reeves, seconded by Mr. Jimmy Taylor and carried unanimously.

Mr. McCoy recommended Board approval of the following revised Personnel items:

**CERTIFIED:**

**Employment:**

- \* Diane Barfield, Half-Time Assistive Tech. Coord., PEC - 8/10/09
- \* Jerry Croft, Teacher, Williams - 8/10/09
- Justin Harrison, Teacher, Gray - 8/10/09
- \* Courtney Thompson, Teacher, Stringfellow - 8/10/09
- Cherie O. White, Teacher, Williams - 8/10/09

**Leave of Absence:**

Jennifer Kirk Bowers, Teacher, CCHS - 8/03/09 - 9/14/09

**CLASSIFIED:**

**Employment:**

- Kirbie Bodiford, Instructional Provider, Gray - 8/10/09
- Marilee Stone Bridges, Paraprofessional, Wright - 8/10/09
- Misty Bridges, Clerk, Gray - 8/03/09
- Donna Brinson, Paraprofessional, CCHS - 8/10/09
- Shunterria Fountain, Interpreter, Systemwide - 8/10/09
- \* Cassandra Griffin, 10-Mo. Clerk, Cox - 8/03/09
- Tashara Jackson, Paraprofessional, CCHS - 8/10/09

**Leave of Absence:** \* Martha Hobbs, Paraprofessional, Okapilco - 8/17/09 - 12/11/09  
Eddie Robinson, Turf Maintenance, Maintenance Dept. - 7/17/09 -  
\* 8/28/09

**Resignation:** Mary Hayes, Kitchen Assistant, Doerun - 7/14/09

**Substitute Teacher** Gary H. Pyle, Rhonda Lynn Swan, Nawiathia S. White  
\* Jody G. Horne

**FOR BOARD INFORMATION ONLY:**

**CERTIFIED:** John Phillips, Transfer from Teacher, Gray to Teacher, CCHS - 8/10/09  
\* Corine Walker, Transfer from Sp. Ed. Contained Teacher, Stringfellow  
to Sp. Ed. Inclusion Teacher, Stringfellow - 8/10/09

**CLASSIFIED:** \* Marian Williams, Transfer from Paraprofessional, Stringfellow to  
Clerk, Stringfellow - 8/10/09

The motion to approve the revised personnel items was made by Mr. Jimmy Taylor, seconded by Mr. Tim Henry and carried unanimously.

Mr. McCoy recommended Board approval for a fulltime position for Career Related Education (CRE) secretary. The motion to approve was made by Mr. Jimmy Taylor, seconded by Mrs. Debra Hampton and carried unanimously.

Mr. McCoy recommended Board approval of the Asthmatic medication policy changes and that they be implemented immediately. The motion to approve was made by Mr. Tim Henry, seconded by Mrs. Trudie Hill and carried unanimously.

Mr. McCoy recommended Board approval of the following School Nutrition Bids:

**COLQUITT COUNTY SCHOOL NUTRITION  
SCHOOL DELIVERY BIDS  
JULY 2009**

ITEM #	PRODU CT NAME	WILLIAMS		GLOVER		ACC		DADE PAPER		FULTON		RECOM 'D BID	RECOM 'D BIDDER	REASON FOR NOT ACCEPTIN G LOW BID
		PACK	BID UNIT COST	PACK	BID UNIT COST	PACK	BID UNIT COST	PACK	BID UNIT COST	PACK	BID UNIT COST			
110000	Ground Beef	4/10#	\$71.60	8/10#	\$149.60	8/10#	\$ 129.70					\$129.70	ACC	pack
110010	Beef Patties 2 Oz.	10#	17.75									\$17.75	Williams	
110015	Beef Patties 3 Oz.	50/3.2 oz	\$21.65									\$21.65	Williams	
110020	Beef Patties 4 Oz.	40/4 oz	\$20.60	60/4 OZ	\$36.20	60/4oz	\$ 32.37					\$20.60	Williams	
110025	Beef Roast	3/28# Avg	\$2.19			3/24lb	\$ 1.87					\$1.87	ACC	
110030	Beef Stew Meat	10#	\$25.71	10#	\$25.90	10#	\$ 24.89					\$24.89	ACC	
110060	Shaved Roast Beef	6/2#	\$54.45			6/2lb	\$ 48.52					\$48.52	ACC	
SN1015	Beef Nuggets , Breaded	320/5 oz	\$22.70	2/5#	\$22.15	96/2.2oz	\$ 27.41					\$22.15	Glover	
SN1020	Beef Patties, Charbroi l	128/2.5 oz	\$40.05	135/2.5 OZ	\$45.00	135/2.5o z	\$ 45.11					\$40.05	Williams	
SN1025	Beef Patties, Chicken Fried	80/3.8 oz	\$30.40	80/3.8 OZ	\$30.65	80/3.8oz	\$ 30.72					\$30.40	Williams	
110170	IQF Chicken	96/4.5 oz	\$36.80	29#	\$35.15	96/4.5oz	\$ 44.67					\$35.15	Glover	
110178	Hot Wings	10#	\$33.65	10#	\$34.12	2/5#	\$ 34.35					\$33.65	Williams	
110179	Honey Wings	10#	\$31.25	10#	\$31.45	80/2oz	\$ 31.52					\$31.25	Williams	
110185	Honey Dijon Nugget					400/.75o z	\$ 56.59					\$56.59	ACC	
110186	Teriyaki Nuggets	400/.75 oz	\$40.68	400/.75 OZ	\$41.65	400/.75o z	\$ 41.77					\$40.68	Williams	
110187	Frozen Diced Chicken	10#	\$27.20	10#	\$28.20	10#	\$ 24.05					\$24.05	ACC	

110215	Chicken Breast Strips	60/3 oz	\$26.30			160/1oz	\$ 16.19					\$16.19	ACC	
SN1033	Chicken Breast Filet, Breaded , FC (whole muscle)	48/3.5 oz	\$35.54	48/3.5 OZ	\$43.70	40/4oz 50/3.2oz	43.26 38.53					\$35.54	Williams	
SN1035	Chicken Breast Filet Patty, Breaded , RTC	50/3.2 oz	\$23.68	53/3 OZ	\$24.15	53/3oz	\$ 24.24					\$23.68	Williams	
SN1038	Chicken Breast Filet, Spicy, Breaded ,RTC (ovenable)	50/3.2 oz	\$25.69	50/3.5 OAZ	\$32.50	50/3.2oz	\$ 25.75					\$25.69	Williams	
SN1045	Chicken Breast Patty, Breaded , FC	60/3.5 oz	\$19.24	60/3.53 OZ	\$19.35	60.3.53oz	\$ 19.41					\$19.24	Williams	
SN1050	Chicken Breast Patty, Grilled, FC	60/3 oz	\$26.57	128/2.5 OZ	\$38.80	60/3oz	\$ 23.24					\$23.24	ACC	
SN1056	Chicken Breast Tender, (whole muscle) RTC	10#	\$25.25	10#	\$23.60	160/1oz	\$ 24.40					\$23.60	Glover	
SN1058	Chicken Breast Tender, Spicy (whole muscle) FC	10#	\$29.40			145/1.1oz	\$ 20.49					\$20.49	ACC	
SN1065	Chicken Breast Chunk Nugget, Breaded ,FC	10#	\$15.70	11#	\$21.80	200/.8oz	\$ 13.62					\$13.62	ACC	
SN1066	Chicken Breast Chunk Nugget, Breaded	10#	\$30.85			1/12#	\$ 30.52					\$30.85	Williams	Brand

	,RTC													
SN1070	Chicken Breast Nugget Patty, Breaded , FC	265/.6 oz	\$15.80	10#	\$14.85	265/.60	\$ 14.67					\$14.67	ACC	
SN1071	Chicken Breast Nugget, Breaded , Wh muscle RTC	51231	\$25.25	10#	\$24.80	200/.8oz	\$ 25.00					\$24.80	Glover	
SN1075	Chicken Nugget, Grilled, Unflavored FC	400/.65 oz	\$37.29			400/.65oz	\$ 36.17					\$36.17	ACC	
110235	Batter Dipped Fish	10#	\$21.60	56/3 OZ	\$19.76	44/3.6oz	\$ 22.28					\$19.76	Glover	
110250	Catfish Nuggets	10#	\$37.50	10#	\$15.65	15#	\$ 16.81					\$16.81	ACC	pack
110255	Fish Sticks			160/1 OZ	\$19.70	160/1oz	\$ 19.13					\$19.13	ACC	
110470	Popcorn Shrimp	4/2.5#	\$29.52	4/2.5#	\$25.90	5/2lb	\$ 19.88					\$25.90	Glover	Brand
SN1095	Fish Nuggets , Pre-Cooked	160/1 oz	\$19.60	160/1 OZ	\$19.05	160/1oz	\$ 19.13					\$19.05	Glover	
SN1097	Fish, Nuggets , Pop Corn			10#	\$19.29	485/.33oz	\$ 19.29					\$19.29	Glover/ ACC	
SN1100	Fish Portions , Pre-Cooked, 1.5 oz meat/alt	56/3 oz	\$21.90	56/3 OZ	\$19.50	56/3oz	\$ 20.43					\$19.50	Glover	
SN1101	Fish Portions , Pre-Cooked, 2 oz meat/alt	44/3.6 oz	\$22.50	44/3.6 OZ	\$22.20	44/3.6oz	\$ 22.28					\$22.20	Glover	
110260	Corndogs, 2.7 OZ	60/2.67 oz	\$16.40	72/4 OZ	\$18.72	60/2.67oz	\$ 16.23					\$16.23	ACC	
110330	Pork & Veg. Eggroll	60/3 oz	\$31.10	60/3 OZ	\$31.21	60/3oz	\$ 31.41					\$31.10	Williams	
110335	Pork & Veg. Eggroll	60/4.2 oz	\$40.63			60/4.2oz	\$ 41.68					\$40.63	Williams	

110360	Frankfurters	50/3 oz	\$16.70	50 CT 10#	\$18.00	1/10#	\$ 15.76					\$15.76	ACC	
110362	Franks, Footlong	70 ct	\$16.86			7/1 10#	\$ 16.85					\$16.85	ACC	
110385	Sausage Links	10#	\$20.75			10lb	\$ 20.66					\$20.66	ACC	
110440	Combo Pack	3/5#	\$20.30	480/5 OZ	\$23.90	12#	\$ 25.43					\$20.30	Williams	
110450	Turkey Roast	2/9-10# Avg	\$2.16	2/9# AVG	\$2.13	3/12#	\$ 2.34					\$2.13	Glover	
110460	Shaved Turkey Ham	3/5#	\$23.44			3/5# 1/2oz per slice	\$ 20.71					\$20.71	ACC	
110461	Buffet Ham	2/12# Avg	\$1.46	2/10# AVG	\$1.35	2/13.5#avg	\$ 1.68					\$1.35	Glover	
110462	Pit Ham	2/13# Avg	\$1.78	1/15# AVG	\$2.23	2/14#avg	\$ 2.05					\$1.78	Williams	
110463	Pork Loin Roasts	6/8# Avg	\$2.19			6/5-8lb	\$ 1.83					\$1.83	ACC	
110465	Ground Turkey	2/10#	\$15.90	2/10#	\$20.60	2/10#	\$ 21.74					\$15.90	Williams	
SN1010	Bar-B-Que, Pork	4/5#	\$46.30	2/5#	\$32.00	4/5# 2/5#	63.00 32.15					\$32.00	Glover	
SN1090	Corn Dogs, Turkey	72/4 oz	\$18.83	72/4 OZ	\$27.50	72/4oz 48/4oz	18.83 20.22					\$18.83	Williams / ACC	
SN1110	Ham, Pork, Pre Sliced					12/16oz	\$ 46.73					\$46.73	ACC	
SN1120	Hams, Pork, Deli	2/10-12# Avg	\$2.15	2/10#	\$1.89	2/8-9lb	\$ 1.89					\$1.89	Glover/ ACC	
SN1130	Hot Dog, Reduced Fat Content Code: B=beef, C=chicken, P=pork, T=turkey	80/2 oz	\$11.33			80ct/2/5lb	\$ 10.03					\$10.03	ACC	
SN1195	Pork Patty, Rib Shape	53/3.1 oz	\$21.25	100/2.9 OZ	\$42.55	53/3.1oz	\$ 19.76					\$19.76	ACC	
SN1200	Turkey Breast, Sliced	12/1#	\$33.56			6/2lb	\$ 33.39					\$33.56	Williams	Brand
SN1200 A	Turkey Breast, Smoked, Sliced			8/1.5#	\$36.80							\$36.80	Glover	

110270	Fiestada Pizza	96/5.19 oz	\$57.00	96/5.2	\$57.55	96/5.15	\$ 57.50					\$57.00	Williams	
110273	Galaxy Pizza, Cheese, IW			72/5	\$44.53	72*4.65	\$ 44.50					\$44.50	ACC	
110274	Galaxy Pizza, Cheese	60/5.35 oz	\$42.95			72/4.65	\$ 41.20					\$41.20	ACC	
110278	Galaxy Pizza, Pepperoni, IW	60/5.46 oz	\$44.90	72/5	\$45.60	72/4.65	\$ 45.50					\$45.50	ACC	pack
110279	Galaxy Pizza, Pepperoni	60/5.46 oz	\$40.00	72/5	\$42.36	72/5	\$ 42.20					\$42.20	ACC	pack
110285	Beef Pizza	96/5 oz	\$50.95			96/5oz	\$ 48.90					\$48.90	ACC	
110290	Cheese Quesadilla, large wedge	48/5 oz	\$28.55			48/5oz	\$ 28.59					\$28.55	Williams	
110305	Chicken Quesadilla, large wedge	48/5 oz	\$29.40	48/5	\$29.50	48/5oz	\$ 29.59					\$29.40	Williams	
SN1168	Pizza, Wedge Cheese-Stuffed Crust, Cheese	70/5.65 oz	\$43.50			72/5.73	\$ 44.85					\$43.50	Williams	
SN1170	Pizza, Wedge Cheese-Stuffed Crust, Pepperoni	72/5.65 oz	\$44.25	70/5.6	\$41.20	70/5.65	\$ 43.40					\$41.20	Glover	
SN1180	Pizza, Wedge, Cheese	96/5 oz	\$47.50			96/5oz	\$ 52.20					\$47.50	Williams	
SN1185	Pizza, Wedge, Pepperoni	72/5 oz	\$43.00	72/5 OZ	\$41.00	96/4.97 72/5oz	53.50 43.47					\$41.00	Glover	
SN1190	Pizza, Wedge, Sausage	96/4.74 oz	\$42.25	96/4.74	\$42.85	96/4.74oz	\$ 42.93					\$42.25	Williams	
110081	Breakfast Ham, Pre-Sliced	153/1.25 oz	\$41.05	153/1.25	\$42.30	12lb	\$ 42.39					\$41.05	Williams	
110082	Pancake Pup	180/.85 oz	\$24.50	180/.85	\$23.85	180/.85oz	\$ 23.91					\$23.85	Glover	

	Bites													
110105	Bkft. Pizza Pockets	96/2.2 oz	\$27.25	96/2.2	\$31.90	96ct	\$ 27.41					\$27.25	Williams	
110106	Morning Sausage Roll	60/2 oz	\$22.10			60/2oz	\$ 21.74					\$21.74	ACC	
110107	Sausage Biscuits	60/2 pk	\$22.95	60 TWIN	\$27.50	60/2oz	\$ 23.37					\$22.95	Williams	
110108	Pancake Pup	40/2.85 oz	\$16.25	40/2.85	\$15.55	40/2.85oz	\$ 15.58					\$15.55	Glover	
110345	Bacon	15#	\$22.10	15#	\$19.38	15lb	\$ 34.51					\$19.38	Glover	
120105	Pancakes	144/1.25 oz	\$9.65	12/12 CT	\$10.76	144/1.2oz	\$ 10.75					\$9.65	Williams	
120110	Waffles	144 ct	\$11.35	144/788 OZ	\$8.39	144/1.3oz	\$ 19.65					\$8.39	Glover	
120125	Belgian Waffle Stix	144/1.1 oz	\$19.35			144/1.1oz	\$ 18.53					\$18.53	ACC	
120136	Mini Donuts	144/1.3 oz	\$24.95									\$24.95	Williams	
SN2010	Breakfast Beef Steak	136/2 oz	\$38.45	136/2 OZ	\$38.97	136/2oz	\$ 39.05					\$38.45	Williams	
SN2025	Breakfast Chicken Patty Breaded	200/1.5 oz	\$37.95	97/1.65	\$16.25	200/1.5oz 97/1.65oz	37.73 16.30					\$16.25	Glover	
SN2035	Breakfast Donut, Cake, lowfat fortified	80/2.2 oz	\$20.20	80/2.2	\$19.65	80/2.2oz	\$ 19.68					\$19.65	Glover	
SN2040	Breakfast Donut, Cinnamon Sugar, lowfat fortified	96/2 oz	\$28.45			96/2.2oz	\$ 25.57					\$25.57	ACC	
SN2045	Breakfast Donut, Powdered Sugar, lowfat fortified	60/3 oz	\$20.64			60/3oz	\$ 20.04					\$20.04	ACC	
SN2048	Breakfast French Toast Sticks	5/2#	\$12.00	300 CT	\$31.00	182/.82oz	\$ 11.68					\$11.68	ACC	

SN2048 A	Breakfast French Toast Sticks WW/WG	160/1 oz	\$18.75	2/5#	\$13.96	160/1oz	\$ 18.51					\$13.96	Glover	
SN2050 A	Breakfast Fruit Pie, WG <i>is it IW?</i>					72/3oz 72/3oz	\$ 18.15					\$18.15	ACC	
SN2055 A	Breakfast Bun, WW, 2 bread	60/2.8 oz	\$24.30	60/2.6 OZ	\$23.27	60/2.8oz	\$ 23.21					\$23.21	ACC	
SN2060	Breakfast Muffins, low fat 1- 19%, 2 to 2.25 oz	96/2 oz	\$22.47	96/2 OZ	\$21.70	96/2oz	23.47 23.47 23.47					\$21.70	Glover	
SN2060 A	Breakfast Muffins, WG/WW , 20- 39%, 1.8oz	96/1.8 oz  96/1.8 oz	26.21  26.21			96/1.8oz 96/1.8oz 96/1.8oz	\$ 22.78					\$22.78	ACC	
SN2061	Breakfast Muffins, 20-35% 2 to 2.25 oz			96/2.13 OZ	\$25.15	48/2oz 48/2oz	14.98 14.98					\$25.15	Glover	
SN2065	Breakfast Pancake Pup, pork sausage	48/2.85 oz	\$17.60	48/2.85 OZ	\$16.95	48/2.85oz	\$ 16.92					\$16.92	ACC	
SN2085	Breakfast Pizza, Bacon & Egg Scramble	128/2.85 oz	\$47.35			128/2.85 oz	\$ 46.74					\$46.74	ACC	
SN2087	Breakfast Pizza, Ham	192/2.49 oz	\$51.10	192/2.49	\$51.10	192/2.49 oz	\$ 51.20					\$51.10	Williams / Glover	
SN2090	Breakfast Pizza, Sausage	192/2.44 oz	\$48.80	192/2.44	\$48.60	128/3.2oz	\$ 42.93					\$48.60	Glover	pack
SN2095	Breakfast Pizza, Sausage & Gravy	128/3 oz	\$46.50	128/3	\$46.00	128/3oz	\$ 46.14					\$46.00	Glover	

SN2111	Breakfast Sausage Links, pork or beef Content Code: B=beef, P=pork	138/1.16 oz	\$19.75	160/1	\$22.10	138/1.16 oz	\$19.24					\$22.10	Glover	pack
SN2116	Breakfast Sausage Patty, Pork FC	80/2 oz	\$20.20	100/1.6	\$21.56	154/1.25 oz	\$27.49					\$27.49	ACC	pack
110135	Cream Cheese	3#	\$5.80	1/3#	\$4.50	1/3#	\$4.15					\$4.15	ACC	
110147	Cheese Sticks, Mozz.	160/1 oz	\$32.90	160 1 OZ	\$30.84	160/1oz	\$32.92					\$30.84	Glover	
110148	Cheese Sticks, Amer.	168/1 oz	\$37.75			100/1oz	\$22.03					\$22.03	ACC	
110155	Cheese Blend, solid	6/5#	\$71.50	4/5#	\$47.38	6/5#	\$58.40					\$58.40	ACC	
110160	Parmesan Cheese	1#	\$4.15	1#	\$3.49	1lb	\$4.40					\$3.49	Glover	
110225	Eggs, Whole	6/5#	\$29.29	6/5#	\$33.35	6/5#	\$27.72					\$27.72	ACC	
120137	Frozen Dinner Rolls	180/2 oz	\$20.70	240/1.5	\$21.20	180/2oz	\$21.14					\$20.70	Williams	
120138	Frozen Dinner Rolls, Wheat	240/1.5 oz	\$21.65	240/1.5	\$21.90	180/2oz	\$22.11					\$22.11	ACC	not 2 oz.
120139	Cinnamon Roll Dough	180/2.5 oz	\$28.35	180/2	\$30.00	180/2oz	\$29.94					\$28.35	Williams	
120140	Breadsticks	175/1.28 oz	\$20.75	144/1.35	\$17.85	144/1.5oz	\$20.48					\$20.75	Williams	pack
120145	Buttermilk Biscuits	180/2.2 oz	\$24.38	216/2.3	\$30.95	216/2.2oz	\$30.46					\$24.38	Williams	
120180	Pocket Pita Bread	240 ct	\$31.63			120/3oz	\$18.79					\$31.63	Williams	pack
120184	10" Tortilla	20/12 ct	\$28.99	12/12	\$21.05	12/12ct	\$13.61					\$13.61	ACC	
120185	6" Tortilla	36/1 doz	\$20.85	24/12	\$19.75	24/12ct	\$13.34					\$13.34	ACC	
120186	Macadamia Nut Cookie	216/1.5 oz	\$41.96	213/1.5	\$34.55	240/1.3oz	\$44.78					\$34.55	Glover	
120187	M&M	216/1.5	\$42.26	213/1.5	\$34.55	320/1oz	\$					\$24.33	ACC	

	Cookies	oz					24.33							
120188	Chocolate Chip	384/1 oz	\$27.39	320/1	\$24.39	320/1oz	\$ 24.33					\$27.39	Williams	pack
120189	Peanut Butter Cookie	384/1 oz	\$27.39	320/1	\$23.39	320/1oz	\$ 24.33					\$23.39	Glover	
120190	Sugar Cookie	384/1 oz	\$27.39	320/1	\$21.61	320/1oz	\$ 21.55					\$21.55	ACC	
120360	Frozen Yogurt	96/4 oz	\$19.37	96/4	\$19.45	96/4oz	\$ 19.42					\$19.37	Williams	
120365	Sherbert	96/4	\$17.40	96/4	\$17.85	96/4oz	17.72 17.72 18.04					\$17.40	Williams	
120370	Margarine	30/1 #	\$16.50	30/1#	\$15.80	30/1lb	\$ 15.34					\$15.34	ACC	
120375	Whipped Topping	12/32 oz	\$28.95	12/16 OZ	\$26.67	12/32oz	\$ 25.83					\$25.83	ACC	
120195	Baby Lima Beans	20#	\$20.70	20#	\$20.49	20#	\$ 25.98					\$20.49	Glover	
120200	Broccoli Spears	12/2#	\$18.90	12/2#	\$17.00	12/2#	\$ 18.35					\$17.00	Glover	
120205	Cut Broccoli	20#	\$12.62	12/2.5#	\$19.60	20#	\$ 12.28					\$12.28	ACC	
120210	Sliced Carrots	20#	\$10.40	20#	\$10.90	30#	\$ 18.91					\$10.40	Williams	
120215	Corn on the Cob	96/3"	\$16.47	96/3"	\$15.80	96/3in	\$ 15.79					\$15.79	ACC	
120217	Frozen Whole Kernel Corn	20#	\$14.50	20#	\$13.95	12/2.5lb	\$ 23.15					\$13.95	Glover	
120220	Field Peas w/Snaps	20#	\$15.90	20#	\$15.00	20#	\$ 15.54					\$15.00	Glover	
120225	Peas & Carrots	20#	\$15.90	20#	\$12.85	30#	\$ 22.50					\$12.85	Glover	
120230	Mixed Vegetables	20#	\$14.40	20#	\$13.51	1/20#	\$ 18.69					\$13.51	Glover	
120235	Calif. Vegetables	20#	\$14.62	20#	\$14.39	20#	\$ 15.65					\$14.39	Glover	
120240	Stir Fry Vegetables	20#	\$15.68	12/2#	\$18.80	20#	\$ 14.57					\$14.57	ACC	
120245	Cut Okra, Breaded	4/5#	\$21.50	4/5#	\$21.35	4/5#	\$ 21.30					\$21.30	ACC	
120247	Cut Okra, Unbreaded	20#	\$14.15	20#	\$14.17	20#	\$ 15.27					\$14.15	Williams	
120250	Turnip Greens	12/3#	\$23.50	6/3#	\$13.29	6/3#	\$ 12.79					\$23.50	Williams	pack

120255	Mustard Greens	12/3#	\$23.50	6/3#	\$12.90	6/3#	\$12.60					\$23.50	Williams	pack
120265	Yam Patties	168/2 oz	\$21.50	168/2 OZ	\$23.80	168/2oz	\$24.20					\$21.50	Williams	
120266	Tiny Whole Potatoes			20#	\$16.13	20#	\$20.65					\$16.13	Glover	
120280	Potato Bars	6/5#	\$17.15	240/2 OZ	\$17.22	6/5#	\$17.45					\$17.15	Williams	
120285	Potato Rounds	6/5#	\$16.57	6/5#	\$16.75	6/5#	\$16.98					\$16.57	Williams	
120286	Onion Rings	12/2#	\$22.50	6/2#	\$17.75	10#	\$11.52					\$11.52	ACC	
120288	Breaded Vegetable Sticks	6/2#	\$19.05	6/2#	\$21.45	6/2#	\$20.74					\$19.05	Williams	
SN2120	Potatoes, Oven Fries, Coated, Crinkle Cut 5/16"-3/8"	6/5#	\$19.62	6/4#	\$17.05	6/4#	\$19.55 \$16.59					\$19.55	ACC	pack
SN2121	Potatoes, Oven Fries, Coated, Straight Cut 3/8"	6/5#	\$19.02	6/5#	\$18.54	6/5# 6/4#	\$18.83 \$17.37					\$18.54	Glover	
SN2122	Potatoes, Oven Fries, Coated, 10-cut Wedges	6/4#	\$17.78			6/4lb	\$17.35					\$17.35	ACC	
120290	Apple Juice Ind.	70/4 oz	\$7.00	72/4	\$7.30	70/4oz	\$6.74					\$6.74	ACC	
120292	Ind Apple Juice	70/6 oz	\$8.81	72/6	\$9.80	70/6oz	\$8.49					\$8.49	ACC	
120295	Grape Juice, Ind.	70/4 oz	\$9.19	72/4	\$8.00	70/4oz	\$9.12					\$8.00	Glover	
120297	Ind Grape Juice	70/6 oz	\$12.14	48/6	\$10.44	70/6oz	\$12.12					\$12.12	ACC	pack
120300	Orange Juice, Ind.	70/4 oz	\$7.95	72/4	\$8.19	70/4oz	\$7.77					\$7.77	ACC	
120302	Ind. Orange Juice	70/6 oz	\$10.16	48/6	\$8.55	70/6oz	\$9.92					\$9.92	ACC	pack
120305	Pineapple Juice,	70/4 oz	\$9.15	72/4	\$9.55	70/4oz	\$9.08					\$9.08	ACC	

120310	Ind. Juice Bars, Frozen	96/2.25 oz 96/2.25 oz 96/2.25 oz 96/2.25 oz	\$9.95	72/3.1	\$10.05	72/3.1oz	\$ 17.99					\$9.95	Williams	
120315	Frozen Peaches	6/4.5#	\$38.43			30#	\$ 34.24					\$34.24	ACC	
120320	Sliced Strawberries	6/6.5#	\$35.25	6/6.5#	\$43.30	6/6.5lb	\$ 38.58					\$35.25	Williams	
120330	Ind. Fruit Cocktail	96/4 oz	\$34.25	96/4	\$34.56	96/4oz	\$ 34.78					\$34.25	Williams	
120335	Ind. Diced Peaches	96/4 oz	\$37.75	96/4	\$38.34	96/4oz	\$ 38.59					\$37.75	Williams	
120340	Ind. Frozen Pears	96/4 oz	\$34.45	96/4	\$34.75	96/4oz	\$ 35.00					\$34.45	Williams	
120345	Ind. Applesauce	96/4 oz	\$35.50	96/4	\$36.15	70/6oz	\$ 18.21					\$18.21	ACC	
120350	Ind. Strawberry Applesauce			72/4	\$18.70							\$18.70	Glover	
130105	Sliced Apples	6/#10 6/#10	22.76 30.67	6/10	\$26.57	6/#10	\$ 25.87					\$25.87	ACC	
130110	Applesauce	6/#10	\$21.75	6/10	\$21.09	6/#10	\$ 21.52					\$21.09	Glover	
130120	Cranberry Sauce	6/#10	\$32.96	6/10	\$37.60	6/#10	\$ 29.75					\$29.75	ACC	
130125	Fruit Cocktail	6/#10 6/#10	28.91 25.45	6/10	\$23.43	6/#10	\$ 31.98					\$28.91	Williams	Import
130130	Grapefruit Sections	12/46 oz	\$29.50	6/10	\$31.80		n/b					\$29.50	Williams	
130150	Sliced Peaches	6/#10 6/#10	24.54 26.45	6/10	\$23.98	6/#10	\$ 22.52					\$22.52	ACC	
130155	Peach Halves	6/#10	\$28.50	6/10	\$28.60	6/#10	\$ 30.89					\$28.50	Williams	
130165	Pear Halves	6/#10 6/#10	24.60 28.79	6/10	\$19.35	6/#10	\$ 28.80					\$28.79	Williams	Import
130175	Pineapple Chunks	6/#10	\$24.25	6/10	\$21.78	6/#10	\$ 22.72					\$21.78	Glover	
130185	Marasch	6/5 gal	\$43.25	6/5	\$51.80	6/1/2gal	\$					\$43.25	Williams	

	ino Cherries			GAL			48.50							
130205	Strawberry Glaze	6/#10	\$28.10	20#	\$16.90	6/#10	\$30.60					\$28.10	Williams	pack
130212	Raisins, Ind.	144/1.5 oz	\$30.95	144/1.5	\$25.40	144/1.5oz	\$25.46					\$25.40	Glover	
130213	Fruit Juice	24/10 oz.	\$15.75				n/b					\$15.75	Williams	
130215	Cheddar Cheese Sauce	6/#10	\$29.25	6/10	\$26.62	6/#10	\$26.07					\$26.07	ACC	
130216	Hotdog Chili	6/#10	\$34.40	6/10	\$43.40	12/24oz	\$18.79					\$34.40	Williams	pack
130220	Peanut Butter	6/5#	\$36.35	6/5#	\$38.43	6/5#	\$38.33					\$36.35	Williams	
130225	Sunflower Seeds	144/1 oz	\$25.85			150/1oz	\$25.21					\$25.85	Williams	Cooked in Peanut Oil
130235	Tuna	6/66.5 oz	\$37.50	6/66.5	\$46.80	6/66oz	\$37.87					\$37.50	Williams	
130240	Green Beans	6/#10	\$19.50	6/10	\$21.36	6/#10 6/#10	19.59 21.03					\$19.50	Williams	
130245	Italian Green Beans	6/#10	\$23.50	6/10	\$22.72	6/#10	\$23.21					\$22.72	Glover	
130250	Kidney Beans	6/#10	\$21.45	6/10	\$20.71	6/#10	\$20.71					\$20.71	ACC	
130255	Pork and Beans	6/#10	\$19.10	6/10	\$19.46	6/#10	\$18.78					\$18.78	ACC	
130257	Refried Beans	6/#10	\$23.50	6/10	\$23.80	6/#10	\$23.42					\$23.42	ACC	
130260	Green Peas	6/#10	\$23.50			6/#10	\$27.17					\$23.50	Williams	
130280	Whole Kernel Corn	6/75 oz	\$22.00	6/75 OZ	\$21.35	6/75oz	\$22.12					\$21.35	Glover	
130285	Tiny Whole Potatoes	6/#10	\$25.75	6/10	\$29.90	20#	\$20.65					\$25.75	Williams	pack
130290	Potato Pearls	12/26 oz	\$41.70	12/28	\$49.14	12/28oz	\$49.46					\$41.70	Williams	
130293	AuGratin Potatoes	6/38 oz	\$39.50	6/36	\$45.45	6/2.5lb	\$45.55					\$39.50	Williams	
130295	Dehy. Cubed Potatoes	6/2.5#	\$31.40				n/b					\$31.40	Williams	
130297	Cubed Potatoes	6/#10	\$21.25	6/10	\$21.63	6/#10	\$21.03					\$21.03	ACC	
130315	Squash	6/#10	\$28.50	6/10	\$27.40	6/#10	\$28.64					\$27.40	Glover	

130330	Dehydrated Onions	15#	\$31.25	15#	\$35.25	15lb	\$ 37.83					\$31.25	Williams	
130335	Pimentos	24/28 oz	\$38.70			24/28oz	\$ 38.64					\$38.64	ACC	
130340	Green Peppers, Dehy.	1#	\$9.96	2#	\$20.60	25oz	\$ 23.38					\$9.96	Williams	
130345	Green Bell Pepper	24/303	\$27.25			24/303	\$ 26.96					\$26.96	ACC	
130350	Celery	6/ Pouch	\$34.42			6#10	\$ 35.25					\$34.42	Williams	
130355	Dill Pickle Spears	5 gal	\$19.50	5 GAL	\$22.65	5gal	\$ 22.61					\$19.50	Williams	
130360	Sweet Pickle Relish	4/1 gal	\$20.65	4/1 GAL	\$21.05	4/1gal	\$ 21.00					\$20.65	Williams	
130370	Tomato Paste	6/#10	\$33.90	6/10	\$30.75	6/#10	31.22					\$30.75	Glover	
130380	Tomatoes, Whole	6/#10	\$17.95	6/10	\$20.80	6/#10	\$ 21.91					\$17.95	Williams	
130382	Tomatoes, Diced	6/#10	\$19.25	6/10	\$18.40	6#10	\$ 19.55					\$18.40	Glover	
130385	Tomatoes, Crushed	6/#10	\$18.25	6/10	\$16.85	6#10	\$ 19.77					\$16.85	Glover	
130390	Salsa	4/1 Gal	\$34.95	1GAL	\$11.90	4/1gal	\$ 41.08					\$34.95	Williams	pack
140005	Baking Powder	5#	\$4.50	10#	\$9.40	5#	\$ 3.84					\$3.84	ACC	
140010	Baking Soda	24/1#	\$11.45	24/1#	\$13.15	12/2lb	\$ 11.72					\$11.45	Williams	
140015	Chocolate Chips	25#	\$32.50	25#	\$30.10	25lb	\$ 29.90					\$29.90	ACC	
140020	Cocoa, unsweetened	5#	\$9.78	5#	\$13.90	5lb	\$ 12.13					\$9.78	Williams	
140025	Coconut	10#	\$15.60	5/2#	\$17.60	5/2lb	\$ 16.19					\$15.60	Williams	
140030	Light Brown Sugar	50#	\$24.40	24/1#	\$18.15	50lb	\$ 24.55					\$24.40	Williams	pack
140035	Granulated Sugar	50#	\$21.40	50#	\$21.28	50lb	\$ 21.60					\$21.28	Glover	
140040	6-x Powdered Sugar	50#	\$24.10	50#	\$24.09	50lb	\$ 24.32					\$24.09	Glover	
140045	Yeast	20/1#	\$46.40	20/1#	\$48.45	20/1lb	\$ 46.74					\$46.40	Williams	
140055	Nonfat Dry Milk	25#	\$49.70	25#	\$74.00	1/25#	\$ 49.90					\$49.70	Williams	

	Breakfast Cereal Bowl Packs Small, prefer WG	96 ct.	\$16.00	96 BOWL	\$17.12	96 ct.	\$ 17.15					\$16.00		
SN2019													Williams	
140070	Krispy Rice Cereal	12/13 oz	\$20.25	4/27 OZ	\$29.15	4/35oz	\$ 13.70					\$13.70	ACC	
140075	Grits	8/5#	\$17.75	8/5#	\$14.22	8/5lb	\$ 14.46					\$14.22	Glover	
140080	Oats, Quick Cooking	12/42 oz	\$22.10	12/42 OZ	\$24.60	12/42oz	\$ 22.28					\$22.10	Williams	
140082	Mini Cookies, Ind.	150/1 oz	\$25.15	150/1 OZ	\$25.43	150/1oz	\$ 26.13					\$25.15	Williams	
140083	Mini Cookies, Ind.	150/1 oz.	\$25.15	150/1 OZ	\$25.43	150/1oz	\$ 26.13					\$25.15	Williams	
140084	Mini Cookies, Ind.	150/1 oz.	\$25.15			150/1oz	\$ 26.13					\$25.15	Williams	
140085	Graham Crackers, Ind	150/3 pk.	\$14.55	150/3 CT	\$13.52	150/3ct	\$ 14.13					\$13.52	Glover	
140095	Saltines, Individual	300/4 pk	\$11.50	300/4	\$10.88	300/4ct	\$ 11.17					\$10.88	Glover	
140101	Dolphin Crackers	100/9 oz	\$13.10	100/9	\$12.62	100/9oz	\$ 13.36					\$12.62	Glover	
140102	Zoo Crackers	100/1 oz	\$11.70	100/1	\$11.03	100/1oz	\$ 11.76					\$11.03	Glover	
140106	Ind. Crackers	216/6 ct 216/6 ct	\$30.43	144/6 CT	\$22.47	144/6ct	\$ 21.78					\$30.43	Williams	pack
140109	Rice Krispy Treats	80/1.3 oz	\$29.50	80/1.3	\$28.83	80/1.3oz	\$ 30.65					\$28.83	Glover	
140115	Taco Shells	200 ct	\$12.80	200	\$8.66	200ct	\$ 8.88					\$8.66	Glover	
140125	Nacho Chips	8/2#	\$17.50	6/2#	\$13.86	6/2#	\$ 13.59					\$17.50	Williams	pack
140140	Plain Corn Chips	104/1 oz	\$22.10	104/1 OZ	\$22.60	104/1oz	\$ 22.76					\$22.10	Williams	
140141	BBQ Corn Chips	50/1 oz.	\$10.55	104/1 OZ	\$27.58	See	n/b					\$10.55	Williams	
140142	Cheetos	104/.875 oz	\$22.10	104/1 OZ	\$22.60	104/.88oz	22.76 22.76					\$22.10	Williams	
140143	Doritos	88/.75	\$18.40	104/1	\$22.60	88/.75oz	\$					\$18.40	Williams	

		oz		OZ		72/.50oz	19.25							
140144	Popcorn, Ind.	72/.5 oz	\$15.40	72/1 OZ	\$15.65	72/.50oz	\$ 15.75					\$15.40	Williams	
140145	Kids' Mix	104/1 oz	\$22.10	104/.875 OZ	\$22.60	104/.875	\$ 22.76					\$22.10	Williams	
140146	Pretzels, Ind.	88/1 oz	\$18.40	88/1	\$19.12	88/1oz	\$ 19.25					\$18.40	Williams	
140148	French Dressing	4/1 Gal	\$23.40	4/1 GAL	\$23.64	4/1gal	\$ 23.80					\$23.40	Williams	
140150	1000 Island Dressing	4/1 Gal	\$28.60	4/1 GAL	\$29.53	4/1gal	\$ 29.46					\$28.60	Williams	
140155	Buttermilk Dressing	4/1 Gal	\$28.05	4/1 GAL	\$28.93	4/1gal	\$ 28.86					\$28.05	Williams	
140157	Caesar Dressing	4/1 Gal	\$29.65			4/1gal	\$ 34.78					\$29.65	Williams	
140160	Sweet Red French	4/1 Gal	\$24.00	4/1 GAL	\$23.87	4/1gal	\$ 27.22					\$23.87	Glover	
140165	Italian Dressing	4/1 Gal	\$20.03	4/1 GAL	\$20.90	4/1gal	\$ 15.87					\$15.87	ACC	
140170	Lo-Cal 1000 Island	4/1 Gal	\$22.95			4/1gal	n/b					\$22.95	Williams	
140175	Lo-Cal French Dress.	4/1 Gal	\$23.69			4/1gal	\$ 22.99					\$22.99	ACC	
140180	Lo-Cal Ranch Dress.	4/1 Gal	\$27.50			4/1gal						\$27.50	Williams	
140185	BBQ Sauce	4/1 Gal	\$26.70	4/1 GAL	\$28.60	4/1gal	\$ 26.79					\$26.70	Williams	
140190	Tomato Catsup	6/#10	\$19.10	6/10	\$19.40	6/#10	\$ 19.50					\$19.10	Williams	
140195	Lite Mayonnaise	4/1 Gal	\$21.40	4/1 GAL	\$21.69	4/1gal	\$ 21.63					\$21.40	Williams	
140200	Prepared Mustard	4/1 Gal	\$10.95	4/1 GAL	\$15.30	4/1gal	\$ 15.33					\$10.95	Williams	
140205	Cider Vinegar	4/1 Gal	\$13.35			4/1gal	\$ 9.51					\$9.51	ACC	
140210	Worcestershire Sauce	1 Gal	\$3.70	1GAL	\$4.20	1gal	\$ 4.16					\$3.70	Williams	
140215	Soy Sauce	1 Gal	\$3.55	1GAL	\$4.12	1gal	\$ 4.09					\$3.55	Williams	
140225	Hot Pepper Sauce	12/6 oz	\$13.80	12/6 OZ	\$15.50	12/6oz	\$ 13.15					\$13.15	ACC	
140230	Louisian	24/6 oz	\$11.80	24/6 OZ	\$14.40	24/6oz	\$					\$11.09	ACC	

	a Hot Sauce						11.09							
140255	Apple Jelly	6/#10	\$29.75	12/4 # BAG	\$29.19	12/4lb	\$ 27.18					\$29.75	Williams	pack
140260	Grape Jelly	6/#10	\$29.00	12/4# BAG	\$27.26	12/4lb	\$ 29.11					\$29.00	Williams	pack
140275	1000 Island Mix					18/1gal	\$ 21.20					\$21.20	ACC	
140280	Original Ranch Mix	18/3.2 oz	\$13.05	18/1 GAL	\$16.56	18/1gal	\$ 13.55					\$13.05	Williams	
140285	Creamy French Mix											\$0.00		
140290	Corn Meal, White	25#	\$10.10	25#	\$9.08	25#	\$ 9.33					\$9.08	Glover	
140300	Plain Flour	50#	\$13.60	50#	\$15.31	25lb 25lb	7.69 7.99					\$13.60	Williams	pack
140305	Bread Flour			50#	\$17.33	50lb	\$ 17.28					\$17.28	ACC	
140310	Cake Mix	6/5#	\$21.90	6/5#	\$27.40	6/5lb	\$ 21.58					\$21.58	ACC	
140310	Wheat Flour	50#	\$19.10	50#	\$18.31	50lb	\$ 17.28					\$17.28	ACC	
140312	Brownie Mix	6/5#	\$24.65	6/6#	\$64.70	6/5lb	\$ 23.64					\$23.64	ACC	
140315	Gelatin, Strawberry	6/4.5#	\$26.90	6/4.5#	\$23.78	6/4.5lb	\$ 27.17					\$23.78	Glover	
140316	Gelatin, Cherry	6/4.5#	\$26.90	6/4.5	\$23.78	6/4.5lb	\$ 27.17					\$23.78	Glover	
140317	Gelatin, Lemon	6/4.5#	\$26.90	6/4.5	\$23.78	12/24oz	\$ 19.02					\$23.78	Glover	pack
140318	Gelatin, Lime	6/4.5#	\$26.90	6/4.5	\$23.78	6/4.5lb	\$ 27.17					\$23.78	Glover	
140319	Gelatin, Orange	6/4.5 #	\$26.90	6/4.5	\$23.78	6/4.5lb	\$ 27.70					\$23.78	Glover	
140325	Inst. Pudding, Van.	12/24 oz	\$19.55	12/24 oz	\$19.62	12/24oz	\$ 19.57					\$19.55	Williams	
140326	Inst. Pudding, Choc.	12/24 oz	\$18.60	12/24	\$19.62	12/24oz	\$ 19.57					\$18.60	Williams	
140327	Inst. Pudding, Lemon	12/24 oz	\$20.65	12/24	\$19.62	12/24oz	\$ 20.54					\$19.62	Glover	
140328	Vanilla Pudding	6/#10	\$20.10	6/10	\$17.10	6/#10	\$ 25.60					\$17.10	Glover	
140329	Chocolate Pudding	6/#10	\$20.10	6/10	\$17.10	6/#10	\$ 25.60					\$17.10	Glover	
140330	Catsup, Ind.	1000/9 gm	\$14.85	1000/9G M	\$14.90	1000/9g m	\$ 15.38					\$14.85	Williams	
140335	Mustard, Ind.	1000/5 gm	\$12.60	500/5.5 GM	\$6.85	500/5gm	\$ 11.17					\$12.60	Williams	pack

140342	Mayo, Red. Fat, Ind.	200/9 gm	\$5.95	200/12 GM	\$6.10	200/1/2gm	\$ 11.25					\$5.95	Williams	
140345	French Dressing, Ind.	200/12 gm	\$6.75	200/12 GM	\$9.28	200/9gm	\$ 5.20					\$6.75	Williams	Brand
140347	Ind. French	100/1.5 oz	\$11.40	100/1.5 OZ	\$11.33	100/1.5oz	n/b					\$11.33	Glover	
140349	Ind. Lowfat French	100/1.5 oz	\$12.64				n/b					\$0.00		Brand
140350	1000 Island, Ind.	200/12 gm	\$7.40	200/12 gm	\$6.65	200/9gm	\$ 5.50					\$7.40	Williams	Brand
140352	Ind. 1000 Island	100/1.5 oz	\$11.90	100/1.5 oz	\$12.64	100/1.5oz	n/b					\$12.64	Glover	Brand
140354	1000 Island, Lowfat	100/1.5 oz	\$14.10				n/b					\$0.00		Brand
140355	Ranch Dressing, Ind.	200/12 gm	\$7.84	200/12 gm	\$7.05	200/9gm	\$ 10.14					\$7.84	Williams	Brand
140357	Ind. Ranch	100/1.5 oz	\$11.24	100/1.5	\$10.79	100/1.5oz	\$ 10.98					\$10.79	Glover	
140359	Ind. Ranch Lowfat	100/1.5 oz	\$12.45	100/1.5	\$11.65	100/1.5oz	\$ 11.85					\$11.65	Glover	
140360	Lite Italian Dress., Ind.	100/1.5 oz	\$10.25			200/12gm	\$ 11.41					\$0.00		Brand/Pack
140365	Creamy Italian Dress.	200/12 gm	\$6.86			100/1.5oz	\$ 9.24					\$6.86	Williams	
140370	Tartar Sauce	200/9 gm	\$5.35	200/12 GM	\$6.64	200/9gm	\$ 9.89					\$5.35	Williams	
140375	Sweet & Sour Sauce	100/1 oz	\$9.50	100/1 OZ	\$11.10	100/1oz	\$ 11.20					\$11.10	Glover	Brand
140377	Honey Mustard	100/1 oz	\$9.95	100/1 OZ	\$9.59	100/1oz	\$ 9.67					\$9.59	Glover	
140380	BBQ Sauce	200/12 gm	\$5.50	200/12 GM	\$5.33	200/9gm	\$ 4.61					\$4.61	ACC	
140383	Hot Sauce, Ind.	200/3 gm	\$3.54	200/3 GM	\$2.84	200ct	\$ 9.09					\$2.84	Glover	
140385	Taco Sauce	500/9 gm	\$9.40	200/9 GM	\$3.87	200ct	\$ 4.93					\$3.87	Glover	
140387	Cocktail Sauce	100/1 oz	\$10.95	100/1.5 OZ	\$12.86	100/1oz	\$ 9.57					\$9.57	ACC	
140390	Jelly, Ind.	200/.5 oz	\$6.50	200/10 GM	\$7.68	200/1/2oz	\$ 8.09					\$6.50	Williams	
140395	Maple Syrup, Ind.	100/1.5 oz	\$6.23	100/1.5	\$7.29	100/1.5oz	\$ 6.17					\$6.17	ACC	
140400	Pepper,	6000 ct	\$14.56	3000	\$7.54	3000ct	\$					\$14.56	Williams	pack

	Ind.						7.62							
140405	Salt, Ind	6000 ct	\$8.89	3000	\$4.49	3000ct	\$ 4.49					\$8.89	Williams	pack
140410	Sugar, Ind.	2000 ct	\$8.50	2000	\$7.85	2000ct	\$ 8.00					\$7.85	Glover	
140413	Artificial Sweetner	2000 ct	\$10.50	2/1250	\$11.49	2000ct	\$ 10.23					\$11.49	Glover	pack
140415	Rice	25#	\$11.49	25#	\$13.40	25lb	\$ 14.13					\$11.49	Williams	
140420	Lasagna Noodles	12/1#	\$13.85	10#	\$9.78	12/1lb	\$ 13.74					\$9.78	Glover	
140425	Medium Egg Noodles	10#	\$9.40	10#	\$8.62	2/5lb	\$ 9.54					\$8.62	Glover	
140430	Macaroni	20#	\$12.50	20#	\$12.50	2/10lb	\$ 14.43					\$12.50	Williams / Glover	
140435	Spaghetti	20#	\$12.39	20#	\$12.50	2/10lb	\$ 14.43					\$12.39	Williams	
140440	Rotini	2/10#	\$21.75	10#	\$9.78	20lb	\$ 14.43					\$14.43	ACC	pack
140445	Chocolate Enrober	12/48 oz	\$83.95			3/10lb	\$ 58.98					\$58.98	ACC	
140455	Marshmallows, Mini	12/16 oz	\$12.00	12/1	\$18.40	12/1lb	\$ 12.12					\$12.00	Williams	
140460	Whipped Topping	12/1#	\$25.50	12/11 OZ	\$23.85	12/16oz	\$ 27.17					\$23.85	Glover	
140465	Corn Starch	24/1#	\$16.07	24/1#	\$16.97	24/1lb	\$ 14.94					\$14.94	ACC	
140470	Bacon Bits	10#	\$11.55	10#	\$12.00	10lb	\$ 10.58					\$10.58	ACC	
140475	Croutons	4/2.25#	\$14.77	10#	\$17.90	10lb	\$ 15.39					\$14.77	Williams	
140490	Tea Bags	96/1 oz	\$9.25	96 CT	\$10.20	96/1oz	\$ 9.05					\$9.05	ACC	
140492	French Onion Soup	12/8 oz	\$38.25				n/b					\$38.25	Williams	
140493	Beef Consomme	12/50 oz	\$55.99	12/50 OZ	\$41.40	12/50oz	\$ 25.98					\$25.98	ACC	
140495	Crm. of Chicken Soup	12/50 oz	\$25.89	12/50 OZ	\$26.86	12/50oz	\$ 26.90					\$25.89	Williams	
140500	Mushroom Soup	12/50 oz	\$26.89	12/50 OZ	\$27.79	12/50oz	\$ 22.93					\$22.93	ACC	
140505	Cooking Oil	35#	\$23.29	35#	\$25.90	35lb	\$ 14.13					\$14.13	ACC	
140515	Cooking Spray	6/16.5 oz	\$14.10	6/17 OZ	\$18.43	6/17oz	\$ 19.02					\$14.10	Williams	
140520	Butter Flavor Spray	6/16.5 oz	\$18.87	6/13 OZ	\$24.80	6/16.5oz	\$ 27.58					\$18.87	Williams	

140525	Butter Buds	24/4 oz	\$27.36	24/4 OZ	\$28.19	24/4oz	\$ 18.47					\$18.47	ACC	
140535	Lemon Juice	12/32 oz	\$18.25	12/32 OZ	\$24.15	12/1qt	\$ 18.47					\$18.25	Williams	
140540	Lemon Flavoring	Quart	\$5.95	16 OZ	\$6.69	1qt	\$ 8.11					\$5.95	Williams	
140545	Almond Flavoring	Quart	\$7.65	1 PT	\$9.35	1qt	\$ 8.25					\$7.65	Williams	
140550	Vanilla Flavoring	Gal	\$3.80	1 GAL	\$3.59	1qt	\$ 11.75					\$3.59	Glover	
140560	Red Food Coloring	Quart	\$3.90	32 OZ	\$9.80	1qt	\$ 3.98					\$3.90	Williams	
140565	Green Food Coloring	Quart	\$4.04			1qt	\$ 4.12					\$4.04	Williams	
140570	Yellow Food Coloring	Quart	\$3.76	1 QT	\$6.30	1qt	\$ 3.83					\$3.76	Williams	
140575	Beef Base	12/1#	\$38.20	6/1#	\$20.98	6/1lb	\$ 34.24					\$38.20	Williams	pack
140580	Chicken Base	12/1#	\$36.60	6/1#	\$18.70	6/1lb	\$ 33.98					\$36.60	Williams	pack
140585	Ham Base	12/1#	\$30.55	12/1#	\$30.40	6/1lb	\$ 39.89					\$30.40	Glover	
140600	Sloppy Joe Mix	6/15 oz	\$12.06	6/15 OZ	\$16.39	6/15oz	\$ 11.80					\$11.80	ACC	
140605	Spagetti Sauce Sea.	6/12 oz	\$13.83	6/15 OZ	\$11.95	6/12oz	\$ 13.67					\$11.95	Glover	
140610	Taco Seasoning	5#	\$13.50	6/9 OZ	\$13.80	6/9oz	\$ 7.82					\$7.82	ACC	
140615	Basil, Sweet	12 oz	\$2.98			1/12oz	\$ 2.97					\$2.97	ACC	
140620	Celery, Salt	2#	\$3.20	30 OZ	\$4.20	1/32oz	\$ 22.95					\$3.20	Williams	
140625	Celery, Seeds	16 oz	\$2.75	16 OZ	\$4.40	16oz	\$ 3.39					\$2.75	Williams	
140630	Chili Powder, Ground	20 oz	\$5.15	16 OZ	\$5.85	1/18oz	\$ 4.75					\$5.15	Williams	pack
140635	Chives	1 oz	\$4.25	1.35 OZ	\$6.90	1/1oz	\$ 2.79					\$2.79	ACC	
140640	Cinnamon, Ground	16 oz	\$3.16	16 OZ	\$4.30	1/16oz	\$ 3.25					\$3.16	Williams	
140645	Cloves, Ground	16 oz	\$6.20			1/16oz	\$ 6.46					\$6.20	Williams	
140650	Cream of Tartar	25 oz	\$7.80	25 OZ	\$9.75	1/24oz	\$ 6.73					\$6.73	ACC	
140653	Cumin	16 oz	\$4.70	14 OZ	\$5.65	1/16oz	\$ 4.80					\$4.70	Williams	
140655	Garlic	18 oz	\$4.62	18 OZ	\$4.45	1/19oz	\$					\$4.45	Glover	

	Powder						5.02							
140660	Garlic Salt	38 oz	\$4.40	28 OZ	\$3.98	1/40oz	\$ 4.29					\$4.29	ACC	pack
140665	Ginger, Ground	16 oz	\$4.29	14 OZ	\$4.48	1/14oz	\$ 3.96					\$4.29	Williams	pack
140670	Lemon-Pepper Season.	12 oz	\$3.20	24 OZ	\$6.75	1/18oz	\$ 4.99					\$3.20	Williams	
140675	Marjaro m	12 oz	\$3.05	10 OZ	\$12.50	1/12oz	\$ 3.09					\$3.05	Williams	
140685	Mustard, Ground, Dry	16 oz	\$4.10	16 OZ	\$5.05	1/16oz	\$ 4.19					\$4.10	Williams	
140690	Nutmeg, Ground	16 oz	\$7.90	16 OZ	\$9.30	1/16oz	\$ 8.16					\$7.90	Williams	
140695	Onion Powder	18 oz	\$4.12	20 OZ	\$5.60	1/20oz	\$ 4.67					\$4.12	Williams	
140700	Oregano , Ground	12 oz	\$3.88	12 OZ	\$5.35	1/12oz	\$ 3.97					\$3.88	Williams	
140705	Paprika, Ground	16 oz	\$4.24	16 OZ	\$5.25	1/16oz	\$ 4.37					\$4.24	Williams	
140710	Parsley Flakes	8 oz	\$7.84	10 OZ	\$8.45	1/10oz	\$ 6.73					\$6.73	ACC	
140715	Black Pepper	16 oz	\$5.08	16 OZ	\$6.45	1/16oz	\$ 5.18					\$5.08	Williams	
140730	Poultry Seasoning	12 oz	\$4.43	12 OZ	\$5.40	1/10oz	\$ 3.78					\$4.43	Williams	pack
140735	Sage, Ground	12 oz	\$3.70	6 OZ	\$3.98	1/8oz	\$ 3.22					\$3.70	Williams	pack
140740	Salt	24/26 oz	\$10.63	24/26 OZ	\$8.60	24/26oz	\$ 8.57					\$8.57	ACC	
140745	Seasoning Salt	36 oz	\$4.19	33 OZ	\$4.30	5lb	\$ 12.38					\$4.19	Williams	
140755	Thyme	13 oz	\$15.64	12 OZ	\$19.00	1/12oz	\$ 4.09					\$4.09	ACC	
140760	Fruit Punch Mix	12/21.6 oz	\$11.75	12/18 OZ	\$10.90	12/2gal	\$ 11.34					\$10.90	Glover	
140765	Lemona de Mix	12/21.6 oz	\$11.75	12/18 OZ	\$10.90	12/2gal	\$ 11.34					\$10.90	Glover	
150055	Paper Cups, 1 OZ.	5000 ct	\$32.30	20/250	\$32.23		n/b	5000	\$31.05	5000	\$33.54	\$32.23	Glover	
150060	Paper Cups, 2 OZ.	5000 ct	\$30.10	20/250	\$40.42	20/250ct	n/b	5000	\$39.35	5000	\$42.45	\$30.10	Williams	
150065	Paper Cups, 5.5 OZ	5000 ct	\$60.97				n/b	5000	\$70.80	5000	\$75.35	\$60.97	Williams	
150070	Slaw Cup, 3.25 OZ	20/125 ct	\$37.39	2500	\$36.94	20/125ct	\$ 33.90	2500	\$33.06	2500	\$34.25	\$33.90	ACC	
150075	Slaw Cup Lid	20/125 ct	\$34.40	2500	\$34.06	20/125ct	\$ 32.50	2500	\$31.70	2500	\$35.85	\$32.50	ACC	
150080	Plastic Cup, 2	10/250 ct	\$22.50	2500	\$21.45	20/125ct	\$ 22.28	2500	\$21.73	2500	\$22.89	\$21.45	Glover	

	OZ.													
150085	Plastic Cup, 4 OZ.	20/125 ct	\$38.60	2500	\$38.04	20/125ct	\$ 37.50	2500	\$36.57	2500	\$36.58	\$38.04	Glover	Lid to Fit
150090	Plastic Cup, 5 OZ.	20/125 ct	\$47.60	2500	\$46.86	25/100ct	\$ 47.55	2500	\$46.37	2500	\$49.95	\$46.86	Glover	
150095	Plastic Cup Lids	20/125 ct	\$23.52	2500	\$22.57	20/125ct	\$ 23.04	2500	\$22.47	2500	\$26.09	\$22.57	Glover	
150096	Plastic Cup Lids			2500	\$34.06	20/125ct	\$ 32.50	2500	\$31.70	2500	\$35.85	\$34.06	Glover	Lid to Fit
150100	Plastic Cup Lids			2500	\$34.06	20/125ct	\$ 32.50	2500	\$31.70			\$34.06	Glover	Lid to Fit
150101	Food Container, 4 oz.	1000 ct	\$17.54	25/40	\$14.15	1000ct	\$ 15.37	1000	\$14.99	1000	\$15.72	\$14.15	Glover	
150102	Lid	1000 ct	\$9.89	10/100	\$9.46	1000ct	\$ 8.68	1000	\$8.47	1000	\$8.88	\$9.46	Glover	Lid to Fit
150103	Food Container, 8 oz.	1000 ct	\$25.50	20/25	\$12.63	1000ct	\$ 27.46	1000	\$26.77	1000	\$ 23.35	\$12.63	Glover	
150104	Lid	1000 ct	\$13.70	10/100	\$14.52	1000ct	\$ 15.12	1000	\$14.55	1000	\$ 11.50	\$14.52	Glover	Lid to Fit
150105	Cold Cups, 12 OZ.	1000 ct	\$21.95	40/25	\$19.52	1000ct	\$ 21.17	1000	\$20.65			\$19.52	Glover	
150115	Coffee Cups, 6 OZ.	1000 ct	\$13.93	20/50	\$11.80	1000ct	\$ 12.75	1000	\$12.43	1000	\$ 13.04	\$11.80	Glover	
150176	Pan Saver	100 ct	\$36.10			1000ct	\$ 33.21	250	\$107.50	100	\$ 24.10	\$33.21	ACC	pack
150190	Tablecloth, Wh. Roll	40"x300'	\$11.05	40X300	\$17.90	40x300	\$ 9.97	EA	\$10.80	Roll	\$ 21.75	\$9.97	ACC	
150195	Tablecloth, Ging. Roll	40"x300'	\$32.39					EA	\$27.06	No Bid	No Bid	\$32.39	Williams	
150203	Food Tray	1000 ct	\$24.42	1000	\$25.16	4/250ct	\$ 27.25	1000	\$17.95	1000	\$ 18.88	\$24.42	Williams	
150205	Foam Trays, White	500 ct	\$15.80			500ct	\$ 15.15	500	\$15.90	500	\$ 15.49	\$15.15	ACC	
150206	Foam Trays, Sesame			500	\$16.04	500ct	\$ 15.15	NO BID	NO BID	500	\$ 15.76	\$15.15	ACC	
150214	Clear Hinged Tray	250 ct	\$33.25	250	\$27.95	250ct	\$ 29.60	200	\$25.85	250	\$ 30.82	\$27.95	Glover	pack
150225	Tableware Kit	500 ct	\$24.77	250	\$13.82	250ct	\$ 18.57	250	\$26.40	250	\$ 18.05	\$24.77	Williams	pack
150260	Foil Hotdog Bags	1000 ct	\$30.85	1000	\$33.90		n/b	1000	\$27.75	1000	\$ 26.90	\$30.85	Williams	
150265	Foil	1000 ct	\$32.85	1000	\$36.01		n/b	1000	\$29.95	1000	\$	\$32.85	Williams	

	Hamburger Bags										28.50			
150270	Elbow Gloves	100 ct	\$4.70			4/100ct	\$ 8.42			4/100	\$ 8.75	\$8.42	ACC	pack
150275	Medium Poly Gloves	10/100 ct	\$11.95	10/100	\$13.53	10/100ct	\$ 10.85	10/100	\$6.15	1000	\$ 11.26	\$10.85	ACC	
150280	Large Poly Gloves	10/100 ct	\$11.95	10/100	\$13.53	10/100ct	\$ 10.85	10/100	\$6.15	1000	\$ 17.10	\$10.85	ACC	
160005	Ammonia			12/28 OZ	\$14.85	8/64oz	\$ 8.34	12 QTS	\$8.59	No Bid	No Bid	\$8.34	ACC	
160010	Bleach	6/96 oz	\$12.00	6/96 OZ	\$12.20	6/96oz	\$ 10.88	NO BID	NO BID	6/96 oz	\$ 12.00	\$10.88	ACC	
160015	Cleaner	24/21 oz	\$20.94	24/12 OZ	\$22.90	24/21oz	\$ 20.88	24/21 OZ	\$31.00	24/21 oz	\$ 24.35	\$20.88	ACC	
160025	Pine Oil Cleaner	4/1 Gal	\$18.52	4/1 GAL	\$22.40	12/28oz	\$ 9.20	NO BID	NO BID	4/1 gal	\$ 21.38	\$9.20	ACC	
160035	Disinfectant Spray	12/20 oz	\$46.37	12/19 OZ	\$67.59	12/19oz	\$ 62.67	12/15.5 OZ	\$26.00	12/19 oz	\$ 68.55	\$46.37	ACC	Williams

Fulton Paper Company and Dade Paper Company rescinded their bids.

The motion to approve was made by Mrs. Debra Hampton, seconded by Mr. Tim Henry and carried unanimously.

Mr. McCoy gave information on items from the Superintendent:  
 School Nutrition Financial Report  
 Financial Reports of June 30, 2009  
 The Board Flower Fund

There being no further business the meeting was adjourned.

---

Mrs. Jerry Meister, Chairman

---

Mr. Leonard McCoy, Superintendent